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Shadow Teacher
training program

Curriculum
 (5 Weeks)

Definition and role of a
Shadow Teacher
Understanding different
learning needs
The importance of
Inclusive education
Legal and Ethical
considerations

“This 1 month
program equips

individuals with the
knowledge and skills
necessary to become

effective shadow
teachers”

Day 1
Introduction to
Shadow Teaching

Day 2  Understanding
Students  with
Disabi l i t ies

Common learning
disabilities (e.g.,
Dyslexia, ADHD, Autism
Spectrum Disorder)
Characteristics and
challenges of each
disability
Communication
strategies for diverse
learners
Collaboration with
Special Education Teams

Day 3  
Classroom Strategies
and Modif icat ions

Differentiated
instruction techniques
Creating a positive and
supportive learning
environment
Behaviour management
strategies for
individualized needs
Adapting curriculum
materials



Effective
communication with
students, parents, and
teachers
Collaboration techniques
for IEP development and
implementation
Building positive
relationships with all
stakeholders
Conflict resolution
strategies in the
classroom setting

Day 4
Communicat ion and
Col laborat ion

Day 5
Socia l  and Emotional
Learning  (SEL)  for
Shadow Teachers

Identifying and
addressing social-
emotional needs

Day 6
Assist ive  Technology
for  Shadow Teachers

Introduction to assistive
technology tools
Utilizing technology to
support learning needs
Choosing appropriate
assistive technology for
different disabilities
Ethical considerations in
using technology in
education

Techniques for
promoting self-esteem
and motivation
Fostering social skills
development and peer
interactions
Strategies for managing
anxiety and stress in the
classroom

Day 7
Data  Col lect ion and
Progress  Monitoring

Maintaining a positive
work-life balance
Stress management
techniques for shadow
teachers
Importance of
continuous professional
development
Exploring resources for
shadow teachers

Importance of data
collection for
individualized
instruction
Recording and analyzing
student progress
Using data to modify
instruction and
strategies
Reporting student
progress to parents and
teachers

Day 8
Sel f-Care  and
Professional
Development



Confidentiality and
FERPA (Family
Educational Rights and
Privacy Act)
Maintaining professional
boundaries
Cultural sensitivity and
Diversity in the
classroom
Reporting child abuse
and neglect

Day 9
Legal  and Ethical
Considerat ions

Day 10
Job and placement
from Home Shiksha

Planning for future
success of students with
disabilities
Resources for job search
and placement as a
shadow teacher
Q&A and program wrap-
up

www.homeshiksha.com

Program Fees
Online: ₹2999/- Only
Offline: ₹4999/- Only


